
Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Buckeye
Clayton Paper & 
Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
Veritiv Operating 

Company
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

Chemical 0

A-01
Take Down Fresh 

& Clean
Gal Hillyard HIL0046806 NO NO 50 Buckeye Scenturion 

54351000 - $30.45 $26.95 SP3097 - $53.85 Hillyard and 
Buckeye

Hillyard - 
$26.95; 

Buckeye - 
$30.45

A-05
Clorox 360 

Chemical, Clorox 
total 360

Case NO NO 20 CLO31650
 - $76.54

CLOROX 3/650 
4X GAL /CASE 
SAME $69.99 

case

CX31650 - $87.64 24331081 - $91.95 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $69.99

A-06 Restroom Cleaner Case Comet/Powder NO NO 100
Buckeye Sanicare 
DRC 52700600 - 

$53.69
PGC75350 - $53.85

COMET 3 GAL 
Per SAME 

CASE - $24.19 
Gallon

PG22569 - $49.08 PGC22569CT - 
$75.62

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $24.19

A-08
Eco Floor Clean 

E33
5 Gal Buckeye 60331400 NO NO 100

Super 
Concentrated  - 

$144.83
SP4830 - $52.33 Buckeye and 

Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$144.83 and 
Royal Paper 

$52.33
Concentrated Dispenser Chemicals and unit

B-01 Carpet Spotter Case YES YES 10
Buckeye Gone 

H20212x1 
53760600 - $91.54

SP3137-12 - $36.90 $98.16 BWK 4821 
$35.99 CASE/12

EV-8-272-4PKSQ - 
$86.11 24425448 - $23.25 Staples $23.25

B-02 Carpet Pre-Spray Case Hillyard HIL0081425 NO NO 60 Buckeye Pathfinder 
53701000 - $93.11 $100.72 SP350904 - $54.96 Hillyard and 

Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$100.72; Royal 
Paper - $54.96

B-05 Neutralizer Case Hillyard HIL0081825 NO NO 50 $126.52 SP3029 - $31.77 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$126.52; Royal 
Paper - $31.77

B-06 Recoat Prep Case Hillyard HIL0083425 NO NO 10

Buckeye E11 All 
Purpose Cleaner 

60111400 - 
$161.14

$95.44 SP008504 - $42.68 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$99.54; Royal 
Paper - $42.68

B-07 Spray Clean HD Case Hillyard HIL0182025 NO NO 30
Buckey E12 Glass 

Cleaner - 60121400 
- $112.45

$201.96 SP4740 - $58.92 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$201.96; Royal 
Paper - $58.92

B-08 Super Shine-All Case Hillyard HIL0080825 NO NO 40

Buckey E22 Neutral 
Floor Cleaner - 

60331400 - 
$144.83

$97.36 SP4736 - $29.05 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$97.36; Royal 
Paper - $29.05

B-09 Suprox Case Hillyard HIL0083825 NO NO 230

Buckeye E15 
Hydrogen Peroxide 
Cleaner 60151400 - 

$126.79

$89.48 SP4820 - $79.20 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$89.48; Royal 
Paper - $79.20

B-10
Eco Hydrogen 
Cleaner - E15

Case Buckeye 60151400 NO NO 100 $126.79 SP4820 - $79.20 Buckeye and 
Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$126.79 and 
Royal Paper 

$79.20

B-12 Top Clean Case Hillyard HIL0081025 NO NO 190
Buckey E33 Neutral 

Floor cleaner 
6031400 - $144.83

$116.68 SP4830 - $55.81 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$116.68; Royal 
Paper - $55.81

B-13 Windo-Clean Case Hillyard HIL0080225 NO NO 70
Buckey E12 Glass 

Cleaner 60121400 - 
$112.45

$109.85 SP4835 - $61.61 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$109.85; Royal 
Paper - $61.61

B-14
Q.T. Plus Arsenal 

24
Case Hillyard HIL0082425 NO NO 2

Buckey E22 One-
Step Disinfectant 

Deodorizer Cleaner 
60221400 - 

$246.17

$93.85 SP4840 - $49.32 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$93.85; Royal 
Paper - $49.32

B-15
Eco Glass cleaner 

E12
Case Buckeye 60121400 NO NO 50 $112.45 SP4835 - $61.61 Buckeye and 

Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$112.45 and 
Royal Paper 

$61.61

B-16 QT 5 Case Hillyard HIL0084625 NO NO 50

Buckey E22 One-
Step Disinfectant 

Deodorizer Cleaner 
60221400 - 

$246.17

$127.51 SP4856 - $143.68 Hillyard Hillyard - 
$127.51

Biohazard

C-01
Deodorant-vomit 

absorb
Each/Canister YES YES 620

Hospeco Vomit 
Absorbant - 400899 

- $6.88

BD150 - $39.40 - 
12/Case

FRS614 SS EA 
$7.64 ea

Tolco 260099 - 25-
2lb Bag/Case - (Full 
Case Only) - $2.79 

Bag

154050 - $7.35

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$39.40



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Buckeye
Clayton Paper & 
Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
Veritiv Operating 

Company
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

C3 Supplies

D-01 Nutra-Rinse Case Hillyard HIL0071622 NO NO 50

Buckeye E22 One-
Step Disinfectant 

Deodorizer Cleaner 
60221400 - 

$246.17

$126.28 SP3029 - $31.77 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$126.28; Royal 
Paper - $31.77

D-02
Re-juv-nal Neutral- 
C3 (6-1/2 gal/case)

Case Hillyard HIL0081625 NO NO 170

Buckeye E23 
Neutral Disinfectant 

60231400 - 
$112.31

$77.72 SP4857 - $44.12 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$77.72; Royal 
Paper - $44.12

D-03
Suprox: C3 (6- 1/2 

gal/case)
Case Hillyard HIL0070422 NO NO 20

Buckeye E15 
Hydorgen Peroxie 

Cleaner 60151400 - 
$112.31

$80.77 SP4820 - $79.20 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$80.77; Royal 
Paper - $79.20

D-04
Eco Neutral 

Disinfectant E23
Case Buckeye 60231400 NO NO 60 $112.31 SP4857 - $44.12 Buckeye and 

Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$112.31 and 
Royal Paper 

$44.12

Carpet Care

E-02
Extraction 
Shampoo

5 Gal YES YES 10
Buckey jet Stream 

53055000 - 
$122.74

SP3096-5 - $49.47 SP473802 - $47.85 919536 - $81.33

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Clayton Paper 
$49.47 and 

Royal Paper 
$47.85

E-03 Defoamer Case/ 1 Gal Hillyard HIL0018304 NO NO 70 Buckeye DeFoam 
54101000 - $98.13

Case of 4 gal. 
$114.16 SP302403 - $75.72 Hillyard and 

Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$114.16; Royal 
Paper - $75.72

Enzyme

F-01
Cleaner-Enzyme (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per Case)

Case ENZO-BAC NO NO 30
Buckeye Scenturion 

54351000 - 
$121.80

SP3097 - $53.85 Royal Paper $53.85

F-02
Liquid Enzyme II (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per Case)

Case Hillyard HIL0047006 NO NO 30
Buckeye Scenturion 

54351000 - 
$121.80

$57.80
NLZymeAway 

4x1 gal per case 
$34.79 case

SP3097 - $53.85
Hillyard and 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

Hillyard $57.80 
and Nu-Life 
Labs, Inc. 

$34.79
Floor Care

G-01
Dust Mop 
Treatment

5 Gal United NO NO 30 Buckeye Aqua Dust 
54085000 - $83.40 SP3013 - $39.88 Royal Paper $39.88

G-02
HR 2000 - Hillyard 
(1 Gallon Bottle. 4 

per Case)
Case Hillyard HIL0053806 NO NO 20 Buckeye Floortonic 

51011000 - $98.13 $91.76 SP4330 - $71.99 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$91.76; Royal 
Paper - $71.99

Floor Care, Gym

H-01
Pre-Game, (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per case) 

Case Hillyard HIL0045206 NO NO 5

Buckeye Odorless 
Mineral Spirits 

51885000 - 
$142.44

$56.12 SP5822 - $44.23 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$56.12; Royal 
Paper - $44.23

H-02 450 Gym Finish 5 Gal Hillyard  HIL0028407 36
Buckeye Coliseum 

450 51845000 - 
$273.17

$275.37 SP5824-5 - $175.03 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$275.37; Royal 

Paper - 
$175.03

Floor Care, Gym, Equipment

I-01
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each Hillyard TKH210 NO NO 20 $41.83 Hillyard $41.83

I-02
Hillyard Quick Pass 

6'
Each Hillyard HIL22300 NO NO 1 $677.23 Hillyard $677.23

I-03
Handle Wood 

Lumathread 6 Ft 
Case/12 CSM4526800 NO NO 10

Impact Handle 60" 
Threaded Wood 
6/Case - $35.90

$110.76
Better Brush 

140472 - $71.88 
Case

Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye 
$35.90; Hillyard 

$110.76

I-04
Screen Disc 13in 

120 Grit 
Case AME501213 NO NO 28 No Bid No Bid

I-05

PAD COMP 
23&30IN FOR 

HIL50108 
MULTIFLOXP

Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO 10 $30.95 Hillyard $30.95

Floor Finish

J-01 Endeavour 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0052507 NO NO 150
Buckeye Clarion 25 

51315000 - 
$104.56

$89.66 SP4050-5 - $73.13 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$89.66; Royal 
Paper - $73.13
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J-02 Explorer 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0053407 NO NO 50
Buckeye Clarion 25 

51315000 - 
$104.56

$104.11 SP4055-5 $102.12 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$104.11; Royal 

Paper - 
$102.12

Floor Stripper $85.50 $49.00

K-01 Power Strip 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0015007 NO NO 150 Buckey Wat NA 
50355000 - $85.50 $49.48 SP0084-5 - $76.59 Hillyard and 

Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$49.48; Royal 
Paper - $76.59

K-02
RipSaw Floor 

Stripper
5 Gal Buckeye 50255000 NO NO 50 $117.87 SP006104 - $72.65 Buckeye and 

Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$117.87 and 
Royal Paper 

$72.66

K-03 Juggernaut 5 Gal Buckeye NO NO 2 $140.57 SP0084-5 - $64.80 Buckeye and 
Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$140.57 and 
Royal Paper 

$64.80

K-04
Baseboard 

Stripper
Case HIL0113355 NO NO 30 Buckey Base Hit 

55459000 - $104.4
Case of 12 cans 

$53.88 SP6097 - $47.93 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$53.88; Royal 
Paper - $47.93

Fogger

L-01
Sanitizing Fogger 

Aerosol
Case Hillyard YES YES 200

Buckeye Scavenger 
Aerosol 55309000 - 

$74.26

Case of 12 cans 
$79.80 DE55002 - $107.97 Hillyard $79.80

General Purpose

M-01 Spray-n-Buff Gal United 534-04 NO NO 25
Buckeye Equity 

Spray Buff 
51081000 - $26.90

SP4440 - $42.72 Buckeye $26.90

M-02  Spray-n-Wipe Gal United 116-04 NO NO 25 Buckeye Blue 
50011000 - $15.43 SP1008 - $53.01 Buckeye $15.43

M-04 Bleach Gal YES YES 25
BZ75003509-GL - 

$3.19
 6 @ CASE 
KIKBLEACH 

$23.77

NVBL-6 - $14.04 or 
SP3090 - $36.61 (4 

Gallons)
815745 - $33.90

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$3.19

M-05 EXPO Cleaner Gal YES YES 32 Buckeye Marauder 
52651000 - $22.92

SP3262.4
- $9.44

1 gal san 81800 
$23.99 gallon 

CASE

SAN81803 - $51.10 or 
SP3262 - $30.48 (4 

Gallons)
364141 - $20.42

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $9.44 and 
Royal Paper 

$30.48

M-06 Vinegar Gal Heinz PPCO901 YES YES 20 PPC9010 - $3.92 DFVINEGAR-6X1G - 
$25.29

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$3.92

M-09
Aerosol Furniture 

Polish
Case Chase Chase 41-09 YES YES 10

Buckeye Status 
Classic Aerosol 

12x1 55409000 - 
$75.50

ZX494725 - $48.14

12 @ case 
Pledge Polish 
SJN 301168 
$36.69 case

Chase 41-09 - 
$37.98 Case

SP6120 - $39.99 or 
SP6120 - $47.45 (12 - 

18 oz cans)

2611680 - $20.08 - 
Case of 6

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $36.69

M-10
I-Force SM-1 

Degreaser
Case Hillyard HIL0048706 YES YES 4 Buckeye XL-100 

50501000 - $72.34
Case of 4 gallons 

$88.92

SP2034 - $36.09 or 
SP6520 - $46.19 (12 - 

18 oz cans)

Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$88.92; Royal 
Paper - $46.19

Hand Sanitizer 

N-01
Hand Sanitizer 

Foaming
Case Hillyard HIL0041003 NO NO 100

Symmetry Foaming 
Hand Snaitzer 

6x1250 ml 
90051120 - 

$108.00

$80.82 SP4604 - $43.03 Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye $108; 
Hillyard $80.82

N-02
Hand Sanitizer 

Dispensers for N-
01

Case Hillyard NO NO 50
Symmetry Prestige 

Black Dispenser 
99600001 - Free

No Charge Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye Free; 
Hillyard Free

N-06
Purell Sanitizer 

8oz bottles
Case NO NO 25

Symmetry Foam 
Sanitizer Pump 

Bottles 12x550 ml 
(18.6 oz 90050050 

- $157.4

Purell GOJ96512 - 
$65.98 12/Case GJ3659-12 - $51.24 Royal Paper $51.24

Hand Soap

O-01
Soap Industrial 
Cherry Gel 2ltr 

 4/Case HIL0041401 NO NO 12
Symmetry Industrial 
Hand Wash 4x2000 
ml 90181200 - $83

$123.52 SP2810 - $69.08 (4 - 1 
Gal bottles)

Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye $83; 
Hillyard 
$123.52
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O-02
Dispenser Hand 
Defense 2 Liter 

Gray
Each HIL22288 NO NO 5

Symmetry Alpine 
Dispenser 

99810001 2 Liter 
99810001 - Free

$14.85 Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye Free; 
Hillyard $14.85

O-03
Soap, Hand Liquid, 

800ml cart.
Case/12 Boardwalk 8100 YES YES 200

Symmetry Green 
Certified Foaming 

Hand Wash 6x1250 
ml 90091120 - 

$62.07

same $41.21 
case

GJ9212-12 - $96 or 
SP2810 - $40.67 (4 - 

1250 ML Carts)
24544868 - $54.82

Buckeye and 
Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc.

Buckeye 
$62.07 and Nu-
Life Labs, Inc. 

$41.21

O-04
Hand Soap 
Dispenser

Case Hillyard NO NO 40
Symmetry Prestige 

Black Dispenser 
99800001 - Free

No Charge Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye Free; 
Hillyard Free

Hand Soap Affinity/Dispensers

P-01

Affinity Citrus 
Fresh 

Antimicrobial 
Foaming Hand 

Soap

Case Affinity HIL0040803 NO NO 200

Symmetry 
Antimicrobial 

Foaming Handwash 
6x1250 ml 

90031120 - $85.00

$51.13 SP460300 - $51.85 (4 - 
1250 ML Carts)

Gojo CS4 1250ml 
4/cs - $42.50 or 

Gojo FMX20 
2000ml 2/cs - 

$28.65

Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye $85; 
Hillyard $51.13

P-02
Affinity Foamy 
Soap Dispenser

Case Affinity HIL22281 NO NO 100
Symmetry Alpine 
White Dispenser 
996100001 - Free

No Charge Gojo 5134-01 - No 
Charge

Buckeye and 
Hillyard 

Buckeye Free; 
Hillyard Free

Hand Soap GOJO/Dispensers

Insecticide

R-01 Insecticide-aero Case Zenex 495785 YES YES 1 ZX495785 - $76.74 SP6903 - $60.81 or 
SP6919 - $61.56

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 

Inc. $76.74 and 
Royal Paper 

$60.80 or 
$61.56

R-02
Insecticide-wasp-

aero
Case Zenex 495975 YES YES 40 ZX495975 - $51.54

12 per case Bee 
Bopper  $48.99 

Per case

SP6820 - $54.48 or 
SP6820 - $64.65 (12 - 

16 oz cans)

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$51.54

Laundry

S-01
Laundry Detergent 

Powder
50lb Hillyard HIL00765 NO NO 15

Lagasse Detergent 
Laundry 40lb Clean 
and Fresh 400864 - 

$51.46

$87.86 SP7001 - $49.20 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$87.86; Royal 
Paper - $49.20

S-03 Builder Laundry 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0995407 NO NO 10 $107.60 Hillyard  $107.60

S-04
Sour 

Laundry/Softener
5 Gal Hillyard HIl0011407 NO NO 10 $141.52 SP7009 - $60.13 Hillyard  $141.52

S-05
Bleach Laundry 

Oxygen
5 Gal Hillyard HIL0913207 NO NO 20 $141.52 SP702004 - $55.80 Hillyard  $141.52

S-06 HS Detergent 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0997007 NO NO 10 $191.15 SP7003 - $71.13 Hillyard  $191.15

S-07
Premium Hand 

Dish Wash Liquid
Gal Hillyard HIL0037306 NO NO 5 Buckeye Dysh 

56011000 - $16.83 $18.95 SP7648-03 - $54.79 Hillyard  $18.95

S-08
Detergent Dish 12 
Above met Saf 1 

Gal
Case Hillyard HIL0350306 NO NO 5 Buckeye Dysh 

56011000 - $67.34 $138.62 SP7658 - $81.71 Hillyard  $138.62

S-09
Dish Sanitizer H-

129
Case Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 Buckeye SaniQ2 

56801000 - $80.77 $104.92 SP7634 - $35.80 Hillyard  $104.92

S-10
Rinse Aid Dish 14 

Above 
Gal Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 Buckey SaniQ2 

56801000 - $20.19 $44.37 SP766104 - $51.68 Hillyard  $4,437.00

Remover

T-01 Goof Off Each WM Barr FG658 NO NO 50

Buckeye Workout 
Muscle cleaner 

Aerosol 55499000 - 
$87.84

SP2216 - $53.13 Buckeye and 
Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$87.84 and 

Royal Paper 
$53.13

T-02
Muscel Cleaner 

E14
Case Buckeye 60141400 NO NO 20 $120.96 SP351502 - $57.43 Buckeye and 

Royal Paper

Buckeye 
$120.96 and 
Royal Paper 

$57.43

T-03
Gum Remover - 

Aerosol
Case Chase CH433-4107 YES YES 35

Buckeye Gum, Tar 
& Oil Remover 

53650400 - $48.14
ZX496855 - $69.90

12 per case 
BWK 353 AC 
$39.99 CASE

Chase CM433-4107 
12/Case - $35.95 

Case
SP6445 - $63.05 653324 - $40.52

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$35.95

T-04 Gum-Go , Liquid QT Hillyard HIL0091204 NO NO 12

Buckeye Gum, Tar 
& Oil Remover 

53650400 - $8.02 
ea.

$19.82 SP2216 - $53.13 Hillyard  $19.82

Restroom Cleaner
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U-01
Light Acid Bowl 

Cleaner
Case of QT Renown REN02835-MS YES YES 10

Buckeye Dy-Phase 
Color Inidicating 

Bowl Cleaner 
52550600 - $70.36

12 per case 
Royal Flush 

Simoniz $26.99 
CASE

SP7120 - $22.98 OR 
SP7115 - $26.32 24517465 - $25.15 Staples $25.15

Urinal Screens

V-02
Urinal Screen 
Wave 3D CUC 
Melon 10/box

Box Fresh Products  NO NO 500

Hospeco Urinal 
Screeen Cucumber 

melon 401244 - 
$19.50

FRS3WDCM-PHS - 
$24.44 $19.85 same $22.50 

BOX

WDSCM Box of 10, 
6 Boxes in a Case - 

$21.95 Box

RLURINAL-FRESH - 
$20.45 OR $SP7115 - 

$26.32
Hillyard  $19.85

Wipes

W-01
Clorox Disinfecting 

Wipes
Each

CLO15949/BUN159
49

NO NO 10 CL015949CT - 
$42.22

6 cannisters per 
case Monk 

wipes $21.89 
case

CL015949 6 
Cans/Case - $8.35 

Can 
CX5949 - $36.63

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$42.22

W-02 All Purpose Wipes Case Hillyard HIL21411 NO NO 10 $29.97 Hillyard  $29.97
Cleaning Equipment

X-01 Jug - 1 qt Each YES YES 20 IP5032HG - $.69 RL9900-EA - $1.18

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$0.69

X-02 Caps(for 1 qt) Each CP02 YES YES 20 IP5021FC - $.90 Included in X-01

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$0.90

X-03 Trigger Sprayer Each Continental 902rw9 NO NO 20 Impact 
400658-$0.95 IP6900 - $.69 Continental 902rw9 

- $0.93 RLTRIGSPRAY - $0.65

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $0.69 and 
Royal Paper 

$0.65

X-05 Pump(for 5 gal) Each RL-PUMP-5 YES YES 15 Tolco 160108 - 
$2.49 RLPUMP-5 - $4.09

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$2.49

X-06 Sprayer, 2 gal Each RLF1972 YES YES 20 R.L. Flowmaster - 
24102 - $16.98 RL-SPRAYER - $48.03 TOC150002 - 

$23.90

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$16.98

X-07
Sprayer, Chem 
Resistant 2 gal

Each RLF1992A YES YES 20 R.L. Flowmaster - 
24102 - $16.98 RL-SPRAYER - $48.03

TOC150012 - 
$30.14

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$16.98

X-08
Bucket-Pail-10 qt. 

plastic
Each Continental CO8110GY YES YES 75 Impact 400562 - 

$10.19
Continental 

CO8110GY - $5.99
RMFG296300GRAY - 

$6.63 24418766 - $10.49
Pyramid 
School 

Products
$5.99

X-09 Janitor Cart Each Continental 184BL YES YES 26 Impact 400642 - 
$230.84

Continental 184BL - 
$139.98

RMFG617388BLA - 
$121.78 451785 - $181.81 Royal Paper $121.78

X-10
Tool Dusting 

Masslinn Orange 
36X5

Each Chix CHI8051 NO NO 5 No Bid No Bid

X-11
Rags, Cotton 

bleached knit rags 
25#

25 lb Bags
K-160 Bleached T-

shirt rags, no collar - 
NOW BXW25C

YES YES 120 Hospeco 400421 - 
$125.15

same BXW256 
$36.41 CASE RL3607-BAG - $29.35 885094 - $37.00

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $36.41 and 

Royal Paper 
$29.35

X-15
Duster - 

Lambswool
Each Impact 3110 YES YES 50 Impact 400876 - 

$3.38 IP3110 - $6.69 23" BWK 9441 
$5.21 EACH

Lambskin Epec 
24PPD - $2.99 LA312FH - $3.76 24418467 - $6.55

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$2.99

X-16
Lambswool 

Duster/Telescopic
Each Renown REN05258 YES YES 50 Impact 400495 - 

$9.24

Exends 35"-48" 
BWK L-3850 
$6.99 EACH

Lambskin 355ESH - 
$4.99 LA350EX - $4.78 24418467 - $6.55 Royal Paper $4.78

X-17

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 250GM 
12x12 Yellow 

12/pack

Package Hillyard HIL20031 NO NO 50 NuFiber 401155 - 
$11.94 $7.87

24 PER PACK 
16X16 BWK 16 
BLU CLOTH K2 
$8.19 per dozen

Monarch 
M9151124YW - 

$6.12

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$6.12

X-18

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 250GM 

12x12 Blue 
12/pack

Case Hillyard HIL20028 YES YES 50 NuFiber 400589 - 
$15.36

MC1212BLU230 - 
$8.49 $7.87 Monarch 

M915112BL - $6.12 219298 - $12.99

Hillyard and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

Hillyard $7.87 
and Pyramid 

School 
Products $6.12

X-19

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 300GM 

16x16 Blue 
12/pack

Package Hillyard HIL20019 YES YES 400 NuFiber 400590 - 
$11.94

MC1616BLU300 - 
$12.94 $10.89 Monarch 

M915107BL - $6.96
RLMICROFIBER-BLU - 

$6.47 24300450 - $9.99 Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard - 
$10.89; Royal 
Paper - $6.47

X-24 Brush, toilet Each United OOO17 YES YES 20 Impact 400575 - 
$0.98 Jan-00 - $1.33 ABCO 00017 - 

$1.71
RLDELUXEBOWLBRU

SH - $2.08 895391 - $2.38 Buckeye $0.98



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Buckeye
Clayton Paper & 
Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
Veritiv Operating 

Company
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

X-25 Swab Each Impact I-204-100 YES YES 600 IP204 - $.82 BWK 00160 $.
89 EA

Impact I-204-100 - 
$0.98

RLBOWLMOP-EA - 
$0.76 24418473 - $1.44

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $0.82 and 
Royal Paper 

$0.76

X-27
Sponges, scrub, 
3M 74 No SUB

Case 3M 74 NO NO 100 NuFibter 400297 - 
$49 MMM74 - $38.57 $41.79

20 PER BOX 
BWK 74 PAD 
$18.99 BOX

RL74 - $10.96 812851 - $24.07
Scotch Brite 3M 
07449 - $41.11

/Case of 24

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. 

$38.57

X-28
Pads, Hand 3M 

green
Case 3M 96 NO NO 20 MMM96 - $33.38 $40.87 MN96 - $28.85 177014 - $37.16

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. 

$33.38

X-29 Magic Erasers PK/4
Procter & 

Gamble
43516 NO NO 50 Nextstep 24/case 

400491 - $24.98 PG43516 - $6.94

6 PACKS x 6 - 
CASE 36 

TOTAL PGC 
79009 $37.97 

CASE

Procter & Gamble 
82038 - $5.79 4/pk

PG79009 - $27.10 6 
per box, 6 boxes per 

Case
801695 - $9.05 Royal Paper $27.10

X-33
Squeegee, 

Complete 10"
EACH Ettore 1165+1330 YES YES 20 Impact 12" 400629 

- $26.33

ET1324 & ET1131 (two 
items make up this line 

item) - $15.36
855264 - $42.31 Royal Paper $15.36

X-35
Window  Cleaning 

Kit
Each Unger PWKOO YES YES 5 Unger PKDO - 

$99.98 UNGCK054 - $122.48 100214 - $124.07
Pyramid 
School 

Products
$99.98

X-36

Starmax Webster 
59" Contemporary 

Cob Web Duster 
with Extension 

Handle

Each StarMax
Model# 050-12; 

Global# 
10071626050127

YES YES 10

Impact 68" 
w/extension 

12/case 400495 -  
$9.24

Beuer Brush 
500108 & 330259 - 

$8.98 Each

FP36340414 & LA117-
5 - $17.26 24418467 - $6.55 Staples $6.55

X-37
WINDOW 

CLEANING KIT
Each Unger UNGCK054 NO NO 11 Unger UNFCK054 - 

$139.95 UNGCK054 - $122.48 Royal Paper $122.48

X-38

UNGER 
MICROFIBER 

WASHING PAD 8" 
GREEN 5EA/CS 

PHW20 Refills for 
Window Kit 
UNGCK054 

Each Unger UNGPHW20 NO NO 25 Unger UNGPHW20 
- $7.99 Each UNGPHW20 - $33.09

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$7.99

X-39

UNGER 
MICROFIBER 

CLEANING PAD 8" 
GREEN 5EA/CS 

PHL20 Refills for 
Window Kit 
UNGCK054

Each Unger UNGPHL20 NO NO 25 Unger UNGPHL20 - 
$5.99 Each UNGPHIL20 - $24.83

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$5.99

Equipment

Extractor

AB-01
Machine, Floor 

20" 175 rpm
Each Viper VIPVN2015 YES YES 15 RoyalLab - RL20 - 

$730.34 368773 - $1,050.79 VN2015 - $980.67

Royal Paper 
andVeritiv 
Operating 
Company  

Royal Paper 
$730.34 and 

Veritiv 
Operating 
Company 
$980.67

AB-02

Whirlamatic VS 20 
Dust Collector 

Bags (6 per 
package)

Pack Advance 391185 NO YES 10 No Bid No Bid

AB-03
Bag Dust 2000 

Burnisher
Each WIN86215070 YES YES 15 No Bid No Bid

Vacuum & Supplies 0

AD-01
Vacuum, Upright 

SC886
Each Sanitaire 886 YES YES 75 SC886G - $259.40

SAME 
EURC886 

$247.99 EACH

Sanitaire 887 - 
$259.98 SN886 - $213.17 SC886G - $243.23 Royal Paper $213.17

AD-02
Vacuum Bags, 

SC886 
Case Sanitaire 63262 B NO NO 10 63262B - $127.40

EUR 6326 BIO 
CT $76.99 

CASE

Sanitaire 6326B - 
$7.99 SN54582A - $20.04

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$7.99

AD-03

Vacuum Bags - 
Tornado- CV38 

Vacuum Bags (10 
per pack)

Pack Tornado K69042940 NO YES 70 GKCV30 - $11.82 514011 - $12.06 Royal Paper $11.82

AD-04
Motor intake Filter 

- Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K57316110 NO YES 50 GKCV30 - $11.82 Royal Paper $11.82

AD-05
HEPA Filter - 

Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K64147600 NO YES 50 GKCV30 - $11.82 Royal Paper $11.82



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Buckeye
Clayton Paper & 
Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
Veritiv Operating 

Company
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

AD-09

Filter H.E.P.A. 
Twin Pack-

Proteam Super 
Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 107315 NO NO 40 PT107315 - $11.39 861595 - $13.29 Royal Paper $11.39

AD-10

Replacement 
Extension Cord-
Proteam Super 

Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 101678 NO NO 40 RL16-50-EXT - $25.64 Royal Paper $25.64

AD-11
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach Pro 
6qt -10/pkg

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 70 PT107314 - $12.69 Royal Paper $12.69

AD-14

Vacuum Bags - 
Super Coach Pro 
10qt (107303)-10

/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107313 NO NO 50 PT107313 - $12.90 319861 - $11.68 Staples $11.68

AD-19
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach 6qt 
(107314)-10/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 70 PT107313 - $12.90 Royal Paper $12.90

AD-20 Bags Each Eureka 53354-3 YES YES 25 SN54582A - $20.04 Royal Paper $20.04

AD-21 Belts Each Eureka 30563A YES YES 200 SAN30563B - $1.59 XXGPGVPBELT01 - 
$1.40 Royal Paper $1.40

AD-22 Cords Each Eureka 52370-12 YES YES 30 SAN52370-12 - 
$38.15 SN52370-12 - $14.42 Royal Paper $14.42

AD-23
Eureka - Sanitaire - 

Beater Bars 12" 
VGII Ball Brg

Each Eureka 53270 NO NO 50 SAN53270 - $26.59 Eureka 53270 - As 
Spec. $17.98 SN53270A - $13.21 Electrolux Sanitaire 

2402224 - $13.23 Royal Paper $13.21

Vacuum, Wet/Dry 0

AE-01
Wet/Dry Vac 

VL500 55 14 Gal 
(No Substitute)

Each ADVANCE ADV107409093 NO NO 1 Advance VL500 
2424767 - $836.10 VL500 - $780-59

Veritiv 
Operating 
Company

$780.59

Waste Collection 0

AF-01
Mobile Collection 

Equipment
Each Continental 4444-1 YES YES 10 Impact 7744-11R - 

$50
JAN1044GY - 

$44.89
RCP264307 

BLU $77.99 EA RMFG2017008 - $76.47

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$44.89

AF-02
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck

Each Rubbermaid 1305-73 YES YES 10
Rubbermaid 

RCP9T13BLA - 
$635

RCP1305-73 - 
$867.90

ACP130573 
BLU $979.71 EA

Rubbermaid 1305-
73 As Spec. 

$799.98

RMFG130573BLUE - 
$62.92

Rubbermaid 
242596 - $789.22 Staples $789.22

Floor Care Equipment & Supplies 0
Brushes/Brooms 0

AG-01 Brooms, Angle Each YES YES 95 O-Cedar 400973 - 
$6.93 BAL345 - $5.98 $14.13 DV091351EM 

$16.59 EA
ABCO BR1024IMH 

$4.99 RLLGANGBRM - $5.45

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW58003) 

24420010 - $7.17

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $5.98 and 

Pyramid 
School 

Products $4.99 

AG-02
Broom, Libman, 
11" path(name 

brand)
Each  YES YES 20 O-Cedar 400973 - 

$6.93 BAL345- $5.98 ABCO 032INB 
$3.59

Libman 2503523 - 
$68.89

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $5.98 and 

Pyramid 
School 

Products $3.59

Dust Mop-Frame, Handle & Heads 0

AH-01
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 NuFiber 400486 - 
$3.94 FQC18 - $2.49 $2.75 CW224418787 

$3.89 EA 
ABCO BH24518WF 

$3.99 RL5X18FRAME - $3.37

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$2.49

AH-02
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52813 YES YES 50 NuFiber 400486 - 
$3.94 FQC18 - $2.49 BWK 1414 

$4.19 EA
ABCO BH24518WF 

$3.99 RL5X18FRAME - $3.37

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$2.49

AH-03
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 NuFiber 400487 - 
$4.19 FQC24 - $2.69 CWZ 24418785 

$3.99 EA
ABCO BH24524WF 

$4.09 RL5X24FRAME - $3.93

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$2.69

AH-04
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52815 YES YES 50 NuFiber 400487 - 
$4.19 FQC24 - $2.69 $3.10 BWK 1424 

$4.72 EA
ABCO BH24526WF 

$4.09 RL5X24FRAME - $3.93

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$2.69



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Buckeye
Clayton Paper & 
Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
Veritiv Operating 

Company
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

AH-05
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 36" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 NuFiber 400489 - 
$5.75 FQC36 - $3.64 $3.78 CWZ 24418774 

$4.60 EACH
ABCO BH24536WF 

$5.99 RL5X36FRAME - $5.06

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$3.64

AH-06
Frame, Dust mop 

5" X 36" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52817 YES YES 50 NuFiber 400489 - 
$5.75 FQC36 - $3.64 BWK 1436 

$5.62 EA
ABCO BH24536WF 

$5.99 RL5X36FRAME - $5.06

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$3.64

AH-07
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 60" Quick 
Change

Each YES YES 50 NuFiber 400493 - 
$11.25 FQC60 - $5.99 ABCO BH24560WF 

$8.99 RL5X60FRAME - $8.43

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$5.99

AH-08
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 60" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52821 YES YES 50 NuFiber 400493 - 
$11.25 FQC60 - $5.99 $5.92 BWK 1460 

$8.40 EA
ABCO BH24560WF 

$8.99 RL5X60FRAME - $8.43

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$5.99

AH-09
Handles, Dust 

Mop Quick Change 
60 IN WOOD

Each HILLYARD HIL22608 YES YES 20 NuFiber 410395 - 
$15.63 HQC160 - $7.49 $10.40 BWK 1490 

$9.90 EA
ABCO 01406NB 

$6.59 RL60DMHDLE - $7.30 Royal Paper $7.30

AH-10
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 18"

Each HILLYARD HIL53402 YES YES 20 NuFiber 410396 - 
$12.15

AJU18CITBB - 
$5.39 $4.84 BWK 1118 

$9.94 EA
ABCO DMTK 

12518 DBL $4.98 Hillyard $4.84

AH-11
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 24"

Each HILLYARD HIL53404 YES YES 20 NuFiber 410333 - 
$14.85

AJU24CITBB - 
$7.11 $6.36 BWK 1124 

$11.97 EA
ABCO DMTL 

12524DBL $4.99 Hillyard $6.36

AH-12
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each HILLYARD HIL53406 YES YES 20 NuFiber 410334 - 
$20.26

AJU36CITBB 
-$10.09 $9.06 BWK 1136 

$14.89 EA

ABCO 
DMTL125363BL 

$6.99

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW56760) 

24418773 - $6.57

Hillyard $9.06

AH-13
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE -5" X 60"

Each HILLYARD HIL53409 YES YES 20 NuFiber 410403 - 
$31.08

AJU60CTTBB - 
$17.09 $22.85 BWK 1360 

$21.79 EA
ABCO DMTL 

16560B $10.99 Hillyard $22.85

AH-14 Dust Mop Brush Each Rubbermaid  FG634200SILV NO NO 50 RCP 6342 
$10.69 EA

As Spec. 
Rubbermaid 

FG634200SILV As 
Spec. $3.69

RMFG634200SILV - 
$3.83

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$3.69

AH-16
Executive Lobby 
Broom w/vinyl 

Handle
Each Rubbermaid FG637400BLA NO NO 75 O-Cdar 400973 - 

$6.93
RCPFG637400BLA  

- $11.33 $10.13 CWZ 442005 
$7.99 EA

As Spec. 
Rubbermaid 

FG637400BLA As 
Spec. $4.89

RMFG637400BLA - 
$4.13

Rubbermaid
(FG637400BLA) 
756806 - $8.75

Royal Paper $4.13

AH-17
Lobby Pro Upright 

Dust Pans - 
Rubbermaid

Each Rubbermaid FG253100 BLA NO NO 75 Impact 402038 - 
$16.44

RCPFG253100BLA 
- $29.44 $22.93 BWK02600 

$16.39

As Spec. 
Rubbermaid 

FG253100BLA  As 
Spec. $8.98

RMFG253100BLA - 
$8.44

Rubbermaid 
(FG253100BLA) 
599847 - $22.45

Royal Paper $8.44

Floor Care, Gym 0

AI-01
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Kit
Each Hillyard HIL50043 NO NO 10 Buckeye 43006118 

- $40.36 $61.88 Buckeye and 
Hillyard

Buckeye 
$40.36 and 

Hillyard $61.88

AI-02
18" Lightweight T-

Bar T Bar Only
Each Hillyard HIL50040 NO NO 3 Buckeye 43006118 

- $40.36 $28.97 Hillyard $28.97

AI-03
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Refill Pads
Each Hillyard HIL50041 NO NO 16 Buckeye 43006000 

- $85.86 $10.23 Hillyard $10.23

AI-04
Multi-flo XP Pad 
Set Kit (1-23" & 1-

30" pad refill)
Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO 10 $30.95 Hillyard $30.95

AI-05
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each HILLYARD TKH210 NO NO 6 $41.83 Hillyard $41.83

AI-06
Hillyard Quick Pass 

6'
Each HILLYARD HIL22300 NO NO 2 $677.23 Hillyard $677.23

Wet Mopping Equipment 0

AJ-01
Wringer-Bucket 

Combo Pack
Each Impact I4Y26363Y YES YES 25 Impact 35 Qt 

400569 - $90.56 IP44263 - $112.10

BWK 2635 
COMBO 

SIDEPRESS 
$61.67 EA

ABCO T01009SPW 
$69.98 IT4Y/2635-3Y - $96.63

Coastwide 
Professional 

(CW21871) 364105 
- $79.99

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $61.67

AJ-02
Wringer-Bucket 
Combo R-maid

Each Rubbermaid 7577-88 NO YES 28 Impact 35 Qt 
400569 - $90.56 JAN2012 - $92.40 $161.67 SAME $179.00 

EA

 RUBBERMAID 
7577-88 As Spec. 

$109.98

RMFG757788YEL - 
$112.36

Rubbermaid 
(FG757788YEL) - 

24357759 - $175.25

Rubbermaid 
757788 - $115.81

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 

Inc. $92.40 and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products 
$109.98 

Wet Mopping Equipment, Heads & Supplies 0



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
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Sub Not Allowed

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
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Sub 

Allowed
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Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

AK-01

O-Cedar Quick-
Change Mop 
Handle, 60", 

Fiberglass, Yellow 

Each O'Cedar DVOCB965166EA NO NO 50 O'Cedar 400496 - 
$13.29

DVOXB965-
166E       $15.79

O'CEDAR  
DVOCB965166EA 

As Spec. $9.79

Stick O'Cedar Mop 
2411932 - $27.26

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$9.79

AK-02
Handle Sure Grip 
Wood 1 1/8 Wet 

Mop Each HILLYARD HIL22689 NO NO
20 O'Cedar 400470 - 

$14.41 $14.29
Hillyard

$14.29

AK-03

Mop, Fast Track 
Finish Narrow 

Band Head Lrg. 
Blue & White Each Hillyard HIL24013 NO NO

50 Champion 400521 - 
$10.06 $6.05

Hillyard
$6.05

Doodlebug, Frame & Handle 0 $25.40

AL-01
Pads, Doodlebug - 
Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)
Case 3M 70071567872 NO NO 20 Americo 400292 - 

$25.40 MMM8541 - $36.25 $49.08 BWK 403 
$27.99 CASE MN8541 - $26.42 3M 8541 5/box - 

973018 - $9.50 Staples $9.50

AL-02

Pads, Doodlebug 
Utility Heavy Duty  
- Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)

Case Hillyard HIL29960 NO NO 130 Americo 400292 - 
$25.40

Case of 4 Paks/5 
Pads per pak 

$19.48

3M 08004 
$48.99 CASE

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $48.99

AL-03
Pads, Doodlebug - 

White (5/box, 4 
boxes/case)

Case 3M 70071313418 NO YES 20 Americo 400294 - 
$29 MMM8440 - $36.25 $49.08

20 @ CASE 
BWK 00401 
$31.99 CASE

RL8440 - $16.80 3M 8440 5/pk - 
973014 - $11.99

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$36.25

AL-04
Doodlebug, Pad 

Holder 
Case 3M YES YES 50 Americo 400650 

-$1.95
MMM70071312089 - 

$16.97

12 PER CASE 
BWK 00405 
$89.99 CASE

MN6472-LAB - $15.33 3M 6472 4/Carton - 
849945 - $149.47

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$16.97

AL-05
Doodlebug, Pad 
Holder (10 per 

case)
Case 3M 70071312089 NO NO 70 Americo 400650 - 

$61.95 $219.76
12 PER CASE 

BWK 00405 
$89.99 CASE

MN6472-LAB - $15.33 3M 6472 4/Carton - 
849945 - $149.47

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. and 
Staples 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $89.99 and 

Staples 
$149.47

Floor Pads 0
Round Pads 0

13" 0

AM-01
White Pads 
POLISH - 13"

Case 3M NO NO 50 Americo 400277 - 
$12.45

MMM4100-13 - 
$16.10 $18.12 3M08477 - 

$22.79CASE MN4100WH13 - $13.91 3M 4100 5/Case - 
848958 - $20.94 Royal Paper $13.91

AM-02
White Pads 
POLISH -13"

Case Not 3M YES YES 50 Americo 400277 - 
$12.45 AC401213 - $13.54 $12.00 BWK 4013 WHI 

$11.00 CASE ACS 41-13 $7.99 RL-WHPOLISH13  
$6.35

3M 4100 5/Case - 
848958 - $20.94 Royal Paper $6.35

AM-03
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 50 Americo 400248 - 

$12.45
MMM5100-13 - 

$16.10 $17.76 MN5100RED13 - $9.26 3M 5100 5/Case - 
848582 - $19.45 Royal Paper $9.26

AM-04
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 Americo 400248 - 

$12.45 AC404413 - $13.54 $12.00 BWK 4013 RED 
$11.00 CASE ACS 51-13 $7.99 RL-REDBUFF13 - 

$6.74
3M 5100 5/Case - 
848582 - $19.45 Royal Paper $6.74

AM-05
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 50 Americo 400145 - 

$12.45
MMM7200-13 - 

$16.10 $18.18 MN7200BLK13 - $14.27 3M 7200 5/pk - 
815324 - $16.13 Royal Paper $14.27

AM-06
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 Americo 400145 - 

$12.45 AC400113 - $13.54 $12.00 ACS 72-13 $7.99 3M 7200 5/pk - 
815324 - $16.13

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$7.99

20" 0 $34.00

AP-01
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case 3M NO NO 140 Americo 400287 - 
$24.25

MMM4100-20 - 
$30.70 $34.53 75069 $24.99 

CASE MN4100WH20 - $17.92 3M 4100 5/case - 
813039 - $28.05 Royal Paper $17.92

AP-02
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case Not 3M YES YES 120 Americo 400287 - 
$24.25 AC401220 - $25.80 $22.76 75069 $24.99 

CASE ACS 41-20 $12.99 RL-WHPOLISH20 - 
$12.30

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW22986) - 

663605 - $19.37

Royal Paper $12.30

AP-03
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case 3M NO NO 120 Americo 400258 - 

$24.25
MMM5100.20 - 

$30.70 $33.82 BWK 4020 RED 
$17.59 CASE

MN5100RED20 - 
$26.54

3M 5100 5/case - 
812823 - $28.05

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $17.59

AP-04
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case Not 3M YES YES 100 Americo 400258 - 

$24.25 AC404420 - $25.80 $22.76 BWK 4020 RED 
$17.59 CASE ACS 51-20 $12.99 RL-REDBUFF20 - 

$12.30

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW22984) - 

663603 - $19.37

Royal Paper $12.30

AP-05
Black Pads STRIP - 

20"
Case Amerco - Elite AC400120 NO NO 310 Americo 400154 - 

$24.25 AC400120 - $25.80 $29.71 BWK 4020 BLK 
$17.59 CASE

3M 7200 5/case - 
813036 - $31.46

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$25.80

AP-06
21" Beige - 

Burnisher Pad
Case Hillyard HIL42521 YES YES 30 AC401521 - $29.94 $27.12 BWK 4021 NHW 

$21.99 CASE ACS 42-21 $13.99

Hillyard and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

Hillyard $27.12 
and Pyramid 

School 
Products 
$13.99

28" 0
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Distribution Inc.

Hillyard Interboro Packaging Corp. Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper Staples Unipak
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Company
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Bid
Vendor Accepted $

AR-01
Twister Green 

Diamond Cleaning 
System

Box/2 435528 YES YES 30 AC435528 - $194.39

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$194.39

Flooring 0

AT-01

Gator Supreme w 
Ultraflex Edge 3 X 

3 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $131.95 SN33CL - $56.18
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$131.95 and 
Royal Paper 
$56.18

AT-02

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

5 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $200.17 SN35CL - $83.15
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$200.17 and 
Royal Paper 
$83.15

AT-03

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $234.28 SN36CL - $96.63
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$234.28 and 
Royal Paper 
$96.63

AT-04

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $370.72 SN310CL - $157.30
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$370.72 and 
Royal Paper 
$157.30

AT-05

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 4 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $292.63 SN46CL - $125.84
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$292.63 and 
Royal Paper 
$125.84

AT-06

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $409.31 SN66CL - $187.64
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$409.31 and 
Royal Paper 
$187.64

AT-07

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

8 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $526.00 SN68CL - $288.76
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$526.00 and 
Royal Paper 
$288.76

AT-08

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $642.00 SN610CL - $380.90
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$642.00 and 
Royal Paper 
$380.90

AT-09

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $824.00 SN810CL - $442.70
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$824.00 and 
Royal Paper 
$442.70

AT-10

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

12 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10 $973.00 SN812CL - $533.71
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard $973 
and Royal 
Paper $533.71

AT-13
Gator SupremeTile 

19.69 x 19.69 Case Gator MATMTILESSN NO NO

10

$194.13 SNTILECL - $254.78
Hillyard and 
Royal Paper

Hillyard 
$194.13 and 
Royal Paper 
$254.78

Personal Protection Signage & Equipment 0
Signage 0

AU-01
Caution Wet Floor 

Sign
Each Impact 9152BH YES YES 20 Impact 400655 - 

$9.11 IP9152BH - $11.72 ABCO#W50001 
$6.99 IT9152W - $8.93

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW21872) - 

364979 - $9.55

Pyramid 
School 

Products
6.99

Personal Protection Equipment/GLOVES 0

AV-01
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF201 Small NO NO 30 Strong 400369 - 
$49.50 STR71042 - $29.90 $31.65 IF 35 $39.99 

CASE

HOSPECO 
GLN106FSM 

$48.90

RPNIT-SM-BASIC - 
$38.20

Ambitex N5201 
(NSM5201) - 

889723 - $62.99

Vanguard A11A11 
- $33.36

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$29.90
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AV-02
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF202 Medium NO NO 60 Strong 400368 - 
$49.50 STR71043 - $29.90 $31.65 IF 35 $39.99 

CASE

HOSPECO 
GLN106FMD 

$48.90

RPNIT-MED-BASIC - 
$38.20

Ambitex N5201 
(NMD5201) - 

902008 - $62.99

Vanguard A11A12 
- $33.36

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$29.90

AV-03
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF203 LARGE NO NO 80 Strong 400367 - 
$49.50 STR71044 - $29.90 $31.65 IF 35 $39.99 

CASE

HOSPECO 
GLN106FLG 

$48.90

RPNIT-LRG-BASIC - 
$38.20

Ambitex N5201 
(NLG5201) - 

902007 - $62.99

Vanguard A11A13 
- $33.36

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$29.90

AV-04
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF204 X-Large NO NO 60 Strong 400370 - 
$49.50 STR71045 - $29.90 $31.65 IF 35 $39.99 

CASE
HOSPECO 

GLN106FXL $48.90
RPNIT-XLG-BASIC - 

$38.20

Ambitex N5201 
(NXL5201) - 

889762 - $62.99

Vanguard A11A14 
- $33.36

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$29.90

AV-05
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Small NO YES 71 Strong 400387 - 
$30.45 STR73012  -$17.90 $23.88 Pride-SM-VPFG  - 

$21.80
F 48 $27.69 

CASE HOSPECO       VPF 
232   $39.90

RPVPF-SM - $23.60
Ambitex V5201 
(VSM5201) - 

889270 - $29.99

Vanguard A23A11 
- $23.21

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$17.90

AV-06
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Medium YES YES 75 Strong 400386 - 
$30.45 STR73013  -$17.90 $23.88 Pride-Med-VPFG  - 

$21.80
F 48 $27.69 

CASE HOSPECO      VPF 
235   $39.90

RPVPF-MED - $23.60
Ambitex V5201 
(VMD5201) - 

889269 - $29.99

Vanguard A23A12 
- $23.21

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$17.90

AV-07
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Large YES YES 130 Strong 400385 - 
$30.45 STR73014  -$17.90 $23.88 Pride-Lrg-VPFG  - 

$21.80
F 48 $27.69 

CASE HOSPECO VPF 
236   $39.90

RPVPF-LRG - $23.60
Ambitex V5201 

(VLG5201) - 
889268 - $29.99

Vanguard A23A13 
- $23.21

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$17.90

AV-08
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 X-Large YES YES 130 Strong 400388 - 
$30.45 STR73015  -$17.90 $23.88 Pride-XL-VPFG  - 

$21.80
F 48 $27.69 

CASE HOSPECO VPF 
238   $39.90

RPVPF-XLG - $23.60
Ambitex V5201 

(VXL5201) - 
889128 - $29.99

Vanguard A23A14 
- $23.21

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$17.90

Toilet Paper/Paper Towels & Dispensers 0
Facial Tissue 0

Paper Towels & Dispensers 0

AX-01 Towels, Multifold Case General 1508 YES YES 10 CT 401096 - $27.62 SELL183204 - 
$23.94 $28.73 SAME $23.79 

CASE RPMFK - $19.10

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW25228) - 

887854 - $28.83

Tork MK520A - 
$21.93

Veritiv 
Operating 
Company

$21.93

AX-02 Towels, Singlefold Case General 1507 YES YES 60 CT 401101 - $32.13 SELL183226 - 
$32.77 $27.02 SAME $24.17 

CASE SCSK1850A - $19.90
Pacfic Blue Basice 

16/pk 23504 - 
498869 - $36.67

Royal Paper $19.90

AX-05
Vondrehle Paper 

Towels; Preserve® 
- 7.9" x 800' 

Case Vondrehle VDC 88O-N NO NO 3,730 CT 401091 - $31.95 $30.45 RE HWT 800K  
$23.99 CASE RPRLKR-800 - $22.78 Tork RK8002 - 

$27.33 Royal Paper $22.78

AX-08
Vondrehle Paper 
Towel Dispenser

Each Vondrehle VDC8864 NO NO 115 $57.20 SAME $66.75 
EA RP3405 - $43.82 Royal Paper $43.82

Toilet Tissue & Dispensers 0

AY-03
Toilet Tissue 2 ply 

rolls(96 rolls)
Case General 201 NO YES 455 CT 401099 - $57.46 BWK6145 - $48.79 $50.78 MAJESTY TP 

$35.00 CASE RPTP-2-SEL - $44.91

Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW26212) 

-365377 - $64.43

Tork TM1616S - 
$45.49

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $35.00

AY-04
Dispenser, TP, 

Double roll
Each Impact 2501 YES YES 30 IP2501 - $26.11 $275.68 IMPACT 2501 AS 

SPFG $21.99 IT2501 - $13.20 Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW60831) - 

24517247 - $31.23

Pyramid 
School 

Products and 
Royal Paper  

Pyramid 
School 

Products 
$21.99 and 

Royal Paper 
$13.20 

AY-05
Dispenser, TP, 

Single roll
Each Impact 2500 YES YES 30 IP2500 - $24.66 $115.84 IMPACT 2500 AS 

SPFG $11.99 IT2500 - $7.58 Coastwide 
Professional 
(CW41170) - 

376447 - $16.95

Pyramid 
School 

Products and 
Royal Paper  

Pyramid 
School 

Products 
$11.99 and 

Royal Paper 
$7.58 

AY-06
Jumbo Roll Tissue; 
Preserve® - 3.54" x 

1000'
Case Vondrehle VDC 1209 NO NO 1,330 CT 401097 - $36.24 SELL1832161 - 

$29.44 $35.70 JQ41000 $26.49 
CASE RPJRT-2-SEL - $24.66 Tork TJ0922A - 

$32.55 Royal Paper $24.66

AY-07
Twin Jumbo Roll 
Tissue Dispenser

Case Vondrehle VDC 3253 NO NO 100 $21.56 GEN 1602 
$18.99 CASE RP3550-EA - $25.28

Hillyard and 
Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc.

Hillyard $21.56 
and Nu-Life 
Labs, Inc. 

$18.99
Can Liners 0
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AZ-01
Liners, HD 30" x 
36" 8 mic. 10 Gal 

Graphite Black
CS/500 Gateway Liners 400769 YES YES 500 $26.10 MR30370MC - 

$22.84 $25.22 Pitt: INT-3037-Reg - 
$14.72

R303708K 
$26.35 CASE

Heritage, Trash 
Bags, 20-30 Gallon, 
30x36, Low 0f!nsity, 
0.5 MIi, Clear, 250 
CT -659385 -$22.55

VCC303708 - 
$12.60

Berry 30x37 8 Mic - 
Black - $15.85

/Case (Direct ship 
minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight)

Interboro 
Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp. $14.72  
and Unipak 

$12.60

AZ-03
Liners, 28" x 43" LL 
6 mil, 23 Gal R-Fit 

Clear
CS/250 Gateway Liners 407594 YES YES 1,200 $29.33 P4430XC - $14.93 $41.26 Pitt: INT-2843-Med - 

$10.92
RST 28436 C 
$19.51 CASE

oastwide 
Professional°' 
Accufit 23 Gal. 

Trash Bags, low 
Density, 0.9 Mil, 

Clear, 25 Bags/Roll, 
8 Rolls (CW22933) 
- 477573 - $36.56

VPC2843 - $13.20

Berry 28x45 9 Mil - 
Black Only - 
$22.27/Case  
(Direct ship 

minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight)

Interboro 
Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp. $10.92 
and Unipak 

$13.20

AZ-04
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 Pitt MRS9285MC YES YES 2,000 16 Mic Clear - 

$25.58
MR59285MC - 

$35.48 $20.01 Pitt: MRS9285MC - 
$25.84

R303716N 
$34.81 CASE

Coastwfde 
Professional1 .. 20-
30 Gal. Trash Bags, 

High Density, 16 
Mic., Natural, 25 

Bags/Rall, 10 Rolls 
(CW19246) - 

847250 - $30.99

303716 - $24.80

Berry 30x37 16 Mic 
- Natural - $29.98
/Case (Direct ship 
minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight) 

Hillyard, 
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Hillyard $20.01, 
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp. $25.84 
and Unipak 

$24.80

AZ-05
Liners, 40"x48" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/250 Pitt MR40483MK YES YES 1,500

Rspec 43x48 12mic 
(holds 75 lbs) - 

$35.2

MR40483MC - 
$29.79 $34.59 Pitt: MR4048MK - 

$24.34
R 404816K 

$29.97 CASE

Coastwide 
Professional.., 

40·45 Gal. Trash 
Bags, High Density, 
22 Mfc., Black, 25 
Bags/Roll, 6 Rolls 

(CW17713)  - 
814867 - $39.89

404816 - $21.50

Berry 40x48 16 Mic 
- Black - $25.91

/Case (Direct ship 
minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight)

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc., 

Interboro 
Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 
Inc. $29.79, 

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp. $24.34 
and Unipak 

$21.50

AZ-06
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.0 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Black
CS/100 Gateway Lines 407144 YES YES 1,000 $33.81 EC415412K - 

$19.99 $35.97 Pitt: INT-4053-XXH - 
$16.82

RSB40531 B 
$17.83 CASE

Coartwlde 
Professional™ 
AccuFit 55 Gal. 
Trash Bags, low 
Density, 1.3 Mil, 

Black, 20 Bags/Roll, 
5 Rolls (CW22753)  

- 472384 - $45.40

4053 - $15.60

Berry 40x53 1.3 Mil 
- Black - $24.90

/Case (Direct ship 
minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight)

Interboro 
Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp. $16.82 
and Unipak 

$15.60

AZ-07
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.2 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Clear
CS/100 Gateway Liners 407279 YES YES 1,220 $40.33 P5435XC - $21.97 $35.97 Pitt: INT-4053-XXH - 

$18.94
RSB405312 B 
$21.29 CASE

Coastwlde 
Professionar"' 

AccuFit 55 Gal. 
Trash Bags, low 
Density, 1.3 Mil, 

Black, 20 Bags/Roll, 
S Rolls {CW22753)  

- 472384 - $45.40

4053 - $15.60

Berry 40x53 1.3 Mil 
- Clear - $24.90

/Case  (Direct ship 
minimum apporx. 
order of 350; No 

Freight)

Interboro 
Packaging 
Corp. and 

Unipak

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp. $18.94 
and Unipak 

$15.60

Waste Management 0
Receptacle-Dolly, Container, & Lid 0

BA-01
Waste Receptacle, 

55 gal.
Each Continental 5500GY NO NO 85 Impact 400628 - 

$100.59 CO5500GY - $78.90 WMRH 5555-G 
$79.99 EA

Rubbermaid 2655 
(3 EA/Case Full 

Case Only) - $59.98
CM5500GY - $102.21

Rubbermaid Brute 
Vented Trash Can 
Receptade without 

Lid, 55 Gallons, 
Gray 

(FG265SOOGRAY)  
- 812585 - $97.30

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$78.90

BA-03
Waste Receptacle, 

Dolly
Each Continental 3255 YES NO 130 Impact 400809 - 

$43.61 CO3255 - $29.40 WMD400 
$25.91 EA

Continental 3255 
As Spec. $28.98 CM3255 - $46.07

Rubbermaid• 
Round Twist On/Off 

Dolly, Black 
(FG2640008LA) - 
451827 - $45.63

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$28.98

BA-04
Waste Receptacle, 

25 gal. Square 
Grey

Each Continental CO25GY YES NO 50 CO25GY - $79.40
Rubbermaid #3569 

(4 ea.  cases full 
cases only) $49.98

CO25GY - $69.25

Rubbermaid 
Untouchable 

Indoor, Outdoor 
Trash Can w/ no lid, 

Beige Resin, 23 
Gal. 

(FG356988BEIG) - 
540559 - $70.51

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 

Royal Paper  

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 

Inc. $79.40 and 
Royal Paper 

$69.25 

BA-05
Round Trash Cans 

- 44QT
Each Rubbermaid RCP2947GRA NO NO 50 RCP29476GRA - 

$25.20

Rubbermaid 
RC2947GRA As 

Spec. Rubbermaid 
#2947 6 gal/cs full 
cases only $8.99

RMFG294700GRAY - 
$21.76

Rubbermaid• 
Untouchable• 

Round Container, 
Gray, 11 Gallon -
RCP2947GRA - 

$23-.96

Pyramid 
School 

Products and 
Royal Paper  

Pyramid 
School 

Products $8.99 
and Royal 

Paper $21.76  
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Sanitary-Equipment Liners & Supplies 0

BC-01
Liners, paper 

500/cs
Case Hospeco KL260 YES YES 50

Gateway  12x21 
12mic 1,000 case 
401170 - $47.56 

($0.05/Liner)

HS260 - $19.90 $25.89 SAME $27.39 
CASE

Hospeco KL250 As 
Spec. $21.85 RC77L-500 - $24.72

IMPACT 
500/Carton 

(25122488) - 
806051 - $30.72

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products  

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 

Inc. $19.90 and 
Pyramid 
School 

Products 
$21.85  

BC-02
Liners, paper 

250/cs
Case Hospeco 6141 YES YES 10

Gateway  12x21 
12mic 1,000 case 
401170 - $47.56 

($0.05/Liner)

HS6141 - $19.29 $12.95 SAME $23.79 
CASE

Hospeco 6141 As 
Spec. $17.99 HSHS6141 - $17.97

IMPACT 
500/Carton 

(25122488) - 
806051 - $30.72

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc. and 
Hillyard

Clayton Paper 
& Distribution 

Inc. $19.29 and 
Hillyard $12.95

BC-03
Waxed Paper 

Liners
Case YES YES 10

Gateway  12x21 
12mic 1,000 case 
401170 - $47.56 

($0.05/Liner)

HS260 - $19.90

IMPACT 
500/Carton 

(25122488) - 
806051 - $30.72

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution 
Inc.

$19.90

Outdoor Supplies 0

BD-01

American Flag 4' X 
6' heavy duty  
outdoor nylon, 

Embroidered

Each NO YES 20 AVTMBE002220 - 
$67.68

Valley Forge 
1200500 As Spec. 

$30.99

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$30.99

Laminating Film 0

BE-01
25"x500' Roll, 2 

1/4" Core, 1 
1/2mil 

Roll NO 0 $21.98 Adam #01-255-1x 
As Spec. $26.98 roll

Leading 
Edge $21.98

BE-02
25"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 406 $19.99 Adam 01-275-1x As 

Spec. $28.98 roll
Leading 

Edge $19.99

BE-03
27"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 161 $21.58

GBC Nap-Lam 
Laminating Film, 5 

Mil, 27" x 500', 
2/Box (3126061) - 
852815 - $91.11

Leading 
Edge $21.58

BE-04
18"x500' Roll, 2 

1/4" Core, 1 
1/2mil 

Roll NO 0 $18.46 Leading 
Edge $18.46

BE-05
18"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 0 $15.38

Swingline 
Laminating Film 
Roll, S Mil, 18'' x 

500', 2/Box 
(3000003) - 379788 

- $70.50

Leading 
Edge $15.38

BE-06
25"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 3mil 
Roll NO 19 $53.28 Adam #03-255-16 

As Spec. $52.98
Leading 

Edge $53.28

BE-07
27"x250' Roll, 1" 

Core, 3mil 
Roll NO 74 $27.87 Leading 

Edge $27.87

BE-08
40" x 250' Roll, 1" 

Core, 3 mil
Roll NO 0 $69.37 Leading 

Edge $69.37




